
Event Lines

Line # Name Item Commodity
Code

Commodity
Description

Quantity UOM Output Type Status Total Award
Quantity

1 CITY HALL
CARPET
CARE

101760 910-09 Carpet Cleaning,
Dyeing,
Installation and
Repair

4.0000 QTLY CM Contract Open

Line Responses By Supplier

Supplier Supplier
Contact

Supplier
Name

Contact Vendor Performance
Evaluation

Score

Contract Quantity Unit Price Extended
Price

Award
Quantity

        431 1 Rite Way
Service,
Inc.

Ben Weil 4.0000 NO BID

        720 3 TC
JANITORI
AL
CLEANIN
G
SERVICE

T Clarke      5250 NO BID

        1014 1 CKC
ENTERPRI
SES

ROSELINE
DIKE

     1919 4.0000 785.00000 3,140.00

        1476 1 HillTop
Business
Services
Inc

Kathleen
McGinley

4.0000 794.00000 3,176.00

        2532 1 Goodwill
Industries
Coast Emp

Cynthia Barnes 4.0000 329.00000 1,316.00

        2995 1 American
Janitorial
Service

Rachel Jones 4.0000 925.00000 3,700.00

Event Lines

Line # Name Item Commodity
Code

Commodity
Description

Quantity UOM Output Type Status Total Award
Quantity

2 CITY HALL
TILE CARE

101761 910-39 Janitorial/Custodi
al Services

4.0000 QTLY CM Contract Open
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Line Responses By Supplier

Supplier Supplier
Contact

Supplier
Name

Contact Vendor Performance
Evaluation

Score

Contract Quantity Unit Price Extended
Price

Award
Quantity

        431 1 Rite Way
Service,
Inc.

Ben Weil 4.0000 NO BID

        720 3 TC
JANITORI
AL
CLEANIN
G
SERVICE

T Clarke      5250 NO BID

        1014 1 CKC
ENTERPRI
SES

ROSELINE
DIKE

     1919 4.0000 1500.00000 6,000.00

        1476 1 HillTop
Business
Services
Inc

Kathleen
McGinley

4.0000 2668.00000 10,672.00

        2532 1 Goodwill
Industries
Coast Emp

Cynthia Barnes 4.0000 4742.00000 18,968.00

        2995 1 American
Janitorial
Service

Rachel Jones 4.0000 850.00000 3,400.00

Event Lines

Line # Name Item Commodity
Code

Commodity
Description

Quantity UOM Output Type Status Total Award
Quantity

3 GAMBLE
BLDG-
CARPET
CARE

101763 910-09 Carpet Cleaning,
Dyeing,
Installation and
Repair

4.0000 QTLY CM Contract Open

Line Responses By Supplier

Supplier Supplier
Contact

Supplier
Name

Contact Vendor Performance
Evaluation

Score

Contract Quantity Unit Price Extended
Price

Award
Quantity

        431 1 Rite Way
Service,
Inc.

Ben Weil 4.0000 NO BID
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Line Responses By Supplier

Supplier Supplier
Contact

Supplier
Name

Contact Vendor Performance
Evaluation

Score

Contract Quantity Unit Price Extended
Price

Award
Quantity

        720 3 TC
JANITORI
AL
CLEANIN
G
SERVICE

T Clarke      5250 NO BID

        1014 1 CKC
ENTERPRI
SES

ROSELINE
DIKE

     1919 4.0000 600.00000 2,400.00

        1476 1 HillTop
Business
Services
Inc

Kathleen
McGinley

4.0000 2394.00000 9,576.00

        2532 1 Goodwill
Industries
Coast Emp

Cynthia Barnes 4.0000 1327.00000 5,308.00

        2995 1 American
Janitorial
Service

Rachel Jones 4.0000 875.00000 3,500.00

Event Lines

Line # Name Item Commodity
Code

Commodity
Description

Quantity UOM Output Type Status Total Award
Quantity

4  GAMBLE
BLDG-TILE
CARE

101766 910-39 Janitorial/Custodi
al Services

4.0000 QTLY CM Contract Open

Line Responses By Supplier

Supplier Supplier
Contact

Supplier
Name

Contact Vendor Performance
Evaluation

Score

Contract Quantity Unit Price Extended
Price

Award
Quantity

        431 1 Rite Way
Service,
Inc.

Ben Weil 4.0000 NO BID
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Line Responses By Supplier

Supplier Supplier
Contact

Supplier
Name

Contact Vendor Performance
Evaluation

Score

Contract Quantity Unit Price Extended
Price

Award
Quantity

        720 3 TC
JANITORI
AL
CLEANIN
G
SERVICE

T Clarke      5250 4.0000 600.00000 2,400.00

        1014 1 CKC
ENTERPRI
SES

ROSELINE
DIKE

     1919 4.0000 500.00000 2,000.00

        1476 1 HillTop
Business
Services
Inc

Kathleen
McGinley

4.0000 312.00000 1,248.00

        2532 1 Goodwill
Industries
Coast Emp

Cynthia Barnes 4.0000 338.00000 1,352.00

        2995 1 American
Janitorial
Service

Rachel Jones 4.0000 475.00000 1,900.00

Event Lines

Line # Name Item Commodity
Code

Commodity
Description

Quantity UOM Output Type Status Total Award
Quantity

5 COMMUNI
TY
SERVICES-
TILE CARE

101768 962-21 Cleaning
Services, Steam
and Pressure

4.0000 QTLY CM Contract Open

Line Responses By Supplier

Supplier Supplier
Contact

Supplier
Name

Contact Vendor Performance
Evaluation

Score

Contract Quantity Unit Price Extended
Price

Award
Quantity

        431 1 Rite Way
Service,
Inc.

Ben Weil 4.0000 NO BID

Page 4 of 12



Line Responses By Supplier

Supplier Supplier
Contact

Supplier
Name

Contact Vendor Performance
Evaluation

Score

Contract Quantity Unit Price Extended
Price

Award
Quantity

        720 3 TC
JANITORI
AL
CLEANIN
G
SERVICE

T Clarke      5250 4.0000 600.00000 2,400.00

        1014 1 CKC
ENTERPRI
SES

ROSELINE
DIKE

     1919 4.0000 1100.00000 4,400.00

        2532 1 Goodwill
Industries
Coast Emp

Cynthia Barnes 4.0000 419.00000 1,676.00

        2995 1 American
Janitorial
Service

Rachel Jones 4.0000 550.00000 2,200.00

Event Lines

Line # Name Item Commodity
Code

Commodity
Description

Quantity UOM Output Type Status Total Award
Quantity

6 CITY LOT-
CARPET
CARE

101764 910-09 Carpet Cleaning,
Dyeing,
Installation and
Repair

4.0000 QTLY CM Contract Open

Line Responses By Supplier

Supplier Supplier
Contact

Supplier
Name

Contact Vendor Performance
Evaluation

Score

Contract Quantity Unit Price Extended
Price

Award
Quantity

        431 1 Rite Way
Service,
Inc.

Ben Weil 4.0000 NO BID

        720 3 TC
JANITORI
AL
CLEANIN
G
SERVICE

T Clarke      5250 NO BID
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Line Responses By Supplier

Supplier Supplier
Contact

Supplier
Name

Contact Vendor Performance
Evaluation

Score

Contract Quantity Unit Price Extended
Price

Award
Quantity

        1014 1 CKC
ENTERPRI
SES

ROSELINE
DIKE

     1919 4.0000 535.00000 2,140.00

        2532 1 Goodwill
Industries
Coast Emp

Cynthia Barnes 4.0000 269.00000 1,076.00

        2995 1 American
Janitorial
Service

Rachel Jones 4.0000 450.00000 1,800.00

Event Lines

Line # Name Item Commodity
Code

Commodity
Description

Quantity UOM Output Type Status Total Award
Quantity

7 CITY LOT-
TILE CARE

101765 962-21 Cleaning
Services, Steam
and Pressure

4.0000 QTLY CM Contract Open

Line Responses By Supplier

Supplier Supplier
Contact

Supplier
Name

Contact Vendor Performance
Evaluation

Score

Contract Quantity Unit Price Extended
Price

Award
Quantity

        431 1 Rite Way
Service,
Inc.

Ben Weil 4.0000 NO BID

        720 3 TC
JANITORI
AL
CLEANIN
G
SERVICE

T Clarke      5250 NO BID

        1014 1 CKC
ENTERPRI
SES

ROSELINE
DIKE

     1919 4.0000 1475.00000 5,900.00

        2532 1 Goodwill
Industries
Coast Emp

Cynthia Barnes 4.0000 2996.00000 11,984.00
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Line Responses By Supplier

Supplier Supplier
Contact

Supplier
Name

Contact Vendor Performance
Evaluation

Score

Contract Quantity Unit Price Extended
Price

Award
Quantity

        2995 1 American
Janitorial
Service

Rachel Jones 4.0000 1300.00000 5,200.00

Event Lines

Line # Name Item Commodity
Code

Commodity
Description

Quantity UOM Output Type Status Total Award
Quantity

8 CITY LOT-
WAREHOU
SE RESTRM
TILE

101786 962-21 Cleaning
Services, Steam
and Pressure

12.0000 MO CM Contract Open

Line Responses By Supplier

Supplier Supplier
Contact

Supplier
Name

Contact Vendor Performance
Evaluation

Score

Contract Quantity Unit Price Extended
Price

Award
Quantity

        431 1 Rite Way
Service,
Inc.

Ben Weil 12.0000 NO BID

        720 3 TC
JANITORI
AL
CLEANIN
G
SERVICE

T Clarke      5250 NO BID

        1014 1 CKC
ENTERPRI
SES

ROSELINE
DIKE

     1919 12.0000 100.00000 1,200.00

        2532 1 Goodwill
Industries
Coast Emp

Cynthia Barnes 12.0000 507.00000 6,084.00

        2995 1 American
Janitorial
Service

Rachel Jones 12.0000 125.00000 1,500.00
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Event Lines

Line # Name Item Commodity
Code

Commodity
Description

Quantity UOM Output Type Status Total Award
Quantity

9 CITY LOT-
WAREHSE
WOMEN
RESTRM

101794 962-21 Cleaning
Services, Steam
and Pressure

12.0000 MO CM Contract Open

Line Responses By Supplier

Supplier Supplier
Contact

Supplier
Name

Contact Vendor Performance
Evaluation

Score

Contract Quantity Unit Price Extended
Price

Award
Quantity

        431 1 Rite Way
Service,
Inc.

Ben Weil 12.0000 NO BID

        720 3 TC
JANITORI
AL
CLEANIN
G
SERVICE

T Clarke      5250 NO BID

        1014 1 CKC
ENTERPRI
SES

ROSELINE
DIKE

     1919 12.0000 100.00000 1,200.00

        2532 1 Goodwill
Industries
Coast Emp

Cynthia Barnes 12.0000 25.00000 300.00

        2995 1 American
Janitorial
Service

Rachel Jones 12.0000 100.00000 1,200.00

Event Lines

Line # Name Item Commodity
Code

Commodity
Description

Quantity UOM Output Type Status Total Award
Quantity

10 CITY LOT-
SANI OPER
OFF TILE

101795 962-21 Cleaning
Services, Steam
and Pressure

12.0000 MO CM Contract Open
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Line Responses By Supplier

Supplier Supplier
Contact

Supplier
Name

Contact Vendor Performance
Evaluation

Score

Contract Quantity Unit Price Extended
Price

Award
Quantity

        431 1 Rite Way
Service,
Inc.

Ben Weil 12.0000 NO BID

        720 3 TC
JANITORI
AL
CLEANIN
G
SERVICE

T Clarke      5250 NO BID

        1014 1 CKC
ENTERPRI
SES

ROSELINE
DIKE

     1919 12.0000 150.00000 1,800.00

        2532 1 Goodwill
Industries
Coast Emp

Cynthia Barnes 12.0000 100.00000 1,200.00

        2995 1 American
Janitorial
Service

Rachel Jones 12.0000 200.00000 2,400.00

Event Lines

Line # Name Item Commodity
Code

Commodity
Description

Quantity UOM Output Type Status Total Award
Quantity

11 INVENTOR
Y MGMT.
RESTROOM
S-TILE

962-21 Cleaning
Services, Steam
and Pressure

12.0000 MO CM Contract Open

Line Responses By Supplier

Supplier Supplier
Contact

Supplier
Name

Contact Vendor Performance
Evaluation

Score

Contract Quantity Unit Price Extended
Price

Award
Quantity

        431 1 Rite Way
Service,
Inc.

Ben Weil 12.0000 NO BID
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Line Responses By Supplier

Supplier Supplier
Contact

Supplier
Name

Contact Vendor Performance
Evaluation

Score

Contract Quantity Unit Price Extended
Price

Award
Quantity

        720 3 TC
JANITORI
AL
CLEANIN
G
SERVICE

T Clarke      5250 NO BID

        1014 1 CKC
ENTERPRI
SES

ROSELINE
DIKE

     1919 12.0000 100.00000 1,200.00

        2532 1 Goodwill
Industries
Coast Emp

Cynthia Barnes 12.0000 25.00000 300.00

        2995 1 American
Janitorial
Service

Rachel Jones 12.0000 100.00000 1,200.00

Event Lines

Line # Name Item Commodity
Code

Commodity
Description

Quantity UOM Output Type Status Total Award
Quantity

12 SANITATIO
N CREW
HOUSE
TILE

101798 962-21 Cleaning
Services, Steam
and Pressure

4.0000 QTLY CM Contract Open

Line Responses By Supplier

Supplier Supplier
Contact

Supplier
Name

Contact Vendor Performance
Evaluation

Score

Contract Quantity Unit Price Extended
Price

Award
Quantity

        431 1 Rite Way
Service,
Inc.

Ben Weil 4.0000 NO BID

        720 3 TC
JANITORI
AL
CLEANIN
G
SERVICE

T Clarke      5250 4.0000 200.00000 800.00
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Line Responses By Supplier

Supplier Supplier
Contact

Supplier
Name

Contact Vendor Performance
Evaluation

Score

Contract Quantity Unit Price Extended
Price

Award
Quantity

        1014 1 CKC
ENTERPRI
SES

ROSELINE
DIKE

     1919 4.0000 100.00000 400.00

        2532 1 Goodwill
Industries
Coast Emp

Cynthia Barnes 4.0000 96.00000 384.00

        2995 1 American
Janitorial
Service

Rachel Jones 4.0000 150.00000 600.00

Event Lines

Line # Name Item Commodity
Code

Commodity
Description

Quantity UOM Output Type Status Total Award
Quantity

13 DEVELOPM
ENTAL
SERVICES-
CARPET

962-21 Cleaning
Services, Steam
and Pressure

4.0000 QTLY CM Contract Open

Line Responses By Supplier

Supplier Supplier
Contact

Supplier
Name

Contact Vendor Performance
Evaluation

Score

Contract Quantity Unit Price Extended
Price

Award
Quantity

        431 1 Rite Way
Service,
Inc.

Ben Weil 4.0000 NO BID

        1014 1 CKC
ENTERPRI
SES

ROSELINE
DIKE

     1919 4.0000 500.00000 2,000.00

        2532 1 Goodwill
Industries
Coast Emp

Cynthia Barnes 4.0000 20.00000 80.00

        2995 1 American
Janitorial
Service

Rachel Jones 4.0000 350.00000 1,400.00
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Event Lines

Line # Name Item Commodity
Code

Commodity
Description

Quantity UOM Output Type Status Total Award
Quantity

14 DEVELOPM
ENTAL
SERVICES-
TILE

910-09 Carpet Cleaning,
Dyeing,
Installation and
Repair

4.0000 QTLY CM Contract Open

Line Responses By Supplier

Supplier Supplier
Contact

Supplier
Name

Contact Vendor Performance
Evaluation

Score

Contract Quantity Unit Price Extended
Price

Award
Quantity

        431 1 Rite Way
Service,
Inc.

Ben Weil 4.0000 NO BID

        1014 1 CKC
ENTERPRI
SES

ROSELINE
DIKE

     1919 4.0000 600.00000 2,400.00

        2532 1 Goodwill
Industries
Coast Emp

Cynthia Barnes 4.0000 25.00000 100.00

        2995 1 American
Janitorial
Service

Rachel Jones 4.0000 650.00000 2,600.00
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