Event Lines

Line# Name Item Commodity Commodity Quantity UoM Output Type Status Total Award
Code Description Quantity
1 Classic CHAIR 425-06 Chairs, Metal 900.0000 EA PO Open
Series 400
Mity-Lite*
Line Responses By Supplier
Supplier Supplier Supplier Contact Vendor Performanc Purchas Quantity Delivery Unit Price Extended Award
Contact Name e Evaluation e Order Date Price Quantity
Score Overrid
e
472 1 American Michael 900.0000 08/05/201 NO BID
Architect Hinson 3
ura
Design
1189 1 Mason,  Joe Conners 3798 900.0000 08/05/201 NO BID
Inc. 3
2892 1 Shiffler  Sheila 900.0000 08/05/201 NO BID
Equipmen Livingston 3
t Sales,
Inc.
2932 1 SBD Doug 900.0000 09/20/201 99.00000 89,100.00
Commerc McKillop 3
ial
Interiors
3552 1 Mity-Lite, Jeremy 900.0000 09/02/201 110.47000 99,423.00
Inc. Spencer 3
3754 1 United Nancy Woods 900.0000 08/05/201 86.00000 77,400.00
Procurem 3
entLP
Event Lines
Line# Name Item Commaodity Commaodity Quantity UoM Output Type Status Total Award
Code Description Quantity
2 metal chair CHAIR RACKS 425-06 Chairs, Metal 4.0000 EA PO Open
racks
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Line Responses By Supplier

Supplier Supplier Supplier Contact Vendor Performanc Purchas Quantity Delivery Unit Price Extended Award
Contact Name e Evaluation e Order Date Price Quantity
Score Overrid
e
472 1 American Michael 4.0000 08/05/201 NO BID
Architect Hinson 3
ura
Design
1189 1 Mason,  Joe Conners 3798 4.0000 08/05/201 NO BID
Inc. 3
2892 1 Shiffler  Sheila 4.0000 08/05/201 NO BID
Equipmen Livingston 3
t Sales,
Inc.
2932 1 SBD Doug 4.0000 09/20/201 294.00000 1,176.00
Commerc McKillop 3
ial
Interiors
3552 1 Mity-Lite, Jeremy 4.0000 09/02/201 256.50000 1,026.00
Inc. Spencer 3
3754 1 United Nancy Woods 4.0000 08/05/201 410.23000 1,640.92
Procurem 3
entLP
Event Lines
Line# Name Item Commaodity Commaodity Quantity UoOM Output Type  Status Total Award
Code Description Quantity
3 SHIPPING FREIGHT 425-06 Chairs, Metal 1.0000 LO PO Open
Line Responses By Supplier
Supplier Supplier Supplier Contact Vendor Performanc Purchas Quantity Delivery Unit Price Extended Award
Contact Name e Evaluation e Order Date Price Quantity
Score Overrid
e
472 1 American Michael 1.0000 08/05/201 NO BID
Architect Hinson 3
ural
Design
1189 1 Mason,  Joe Conners 3798 1.0000 08/05/201 NO BID
Inc. 3
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Line Responses By Supplier

Supplier Supplier Supplier Contact Vendor Performanc Purchas Quantity Delivery Unit Price Extended Award
Contact Name e Evaluation e Order Date Price Quantity
Score Overrid
e
2892 1 Shiffler  Sheila 1.0000 08/05/201 NO BID
Equipmen Livingston 3
t Sales,
Inc.
2932 1 SBD Doug 1.0000 09/20/201 3400.0000 3,400.00
Commerc McKillop 3 0
ial
Interiors
3552 1 Mity-Lite, Jeremy 1.0000 08/05/201 3055.0000 3,055.00
Inc. Spencer 3 0
3754 1 United Nancy Woods 08/05/201 NO BID
Procurem 3
entLP
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